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B.S.B.A. BUSINESS ADMINISTRATION       
DEGREE REQUIREMENTS 

For more information, see the index listings for baccalaureate 
degree parameters, general studies, and academic regulations. 

Specialized Requirements 

Students must complete the following lower-level courses (or 

their approved transfer credit equivalents) with a grade of “C” or 

higher in each course before registering for any upper level course 

in the business curriculum: ENG 1101/03, ENG 1102/04, MTH 

2201, IS 2241, ACT 2291, ACT 2292, ECO 2251, ECO 2252, QM 

2241, LAW 2221, and all 2000-level courses in the major and 

minor.  Students are allowed a maximum of three attempts at com-

pleting each of these courses with a grade of “C” or higher. After 

the third unsuccessful attempt they are dropped from consideration 

for the upper-level Business Program. Students may enroll 

concurrently in the last of these courses along with their initial 

3000-level courses (MGT 3300 and MKT 3300 only) subject to 

their adviser’s approval and consistent with published prerequisite 

requirements.  

Students entering Troy University with an interest in business 

(as freshmen or sophomores) will be enrolled as General Business 

student (GBUS) with a major/concentration declared. A major 

advisor will be assigned to each student. GBUS majors will not be 

allowed to enroll in business courses above the 3300-level until 

they meet entrance requirements.  Students must complete the first 

66 hours (all general studies courses and the entire 2000-level 

business courses, and MGT 3300 and MKT 3300(formerly MGT 

3371 and MKT 3361) with a 2.0 GPA (2.3 GPA for accounting 

majors) before applying for and being allowed to enter the upper-

level Business Program. 

GBUS students must request a program evaluation from as-
signed advisor after completion of 45 hours to ensure they are on 
track to apply for entry into the Upper Division Business courses 

on schedule.  

Upon completion of the last course of the 66-hour require-
ment, and with a GPA of 2.0 (2.3 for accounting majors), students 
may enroll in upper division courses with their advisor approval.   
The student will be enrolled in (up to 18 hours) FIN 3331, QM 
3345, IS 3310, BUS 3382 or ACT 3391 (for accounting majors 
only). Students are also  required to take one-hour Innovative 
Practices/Thought Issues course and take a GBUS core exam and 
other appropriate courses for their particular concentration/major. 
If a student is taking courses on a term basis then these courses 
would be completed over two consecutive terms. Students who do 
not meet the Business Program requirements will be denied entry 
until those requirements are met. 

Students in their last term of completing the 66 hour require-
ment and have less than 15 hours (or less than 6 hours if on terms) 
remaining to meet the 66 hour requirement should contact the 
department of the major of interest. The Department Head/
designate may approve the student to register for up to an addi-
tional twelve hours (if on a semester; two courses if on terms) and 
the one-hour Innovative Practices/Thought class of the courses 
listed above so they may qualify for full-time student status. How-
ever, they must meet the GPA requirement and have obtained “C” 
in those 1000/2000 level courses already taken and that are listed 
in paragraph one; otherwise they will not be allowed to register for 
the additional upper level courses. Students who do not complete 
the final course(s) with a passing grade and a GPA of at least a 2.0 
(2.3 for accounting majors), will not be allowed to take any more 
upper division level courses until they meet the standards. 

Admission as a Transfer Student-Transfer credit will not be 
awarded for any course to be used in the business core or major in 
which a “C” grade or higher has not been achieved. 

Transfer credits acceptable for admission purposes shall be 
evaluated to determine their suitability for degree credit in the 
Sorrell College of Business Administration. The Dean of the Col-
lege will make the final decision concerning transfer credit allowa-
ble within the curricula. 
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successfully completed at Troy University in order to receive 
the B.S.B.A. degree. The thir ty-one hours taken must be in Busi-
ness courses and would not include any General Study courses 
taught by the Sorrell College of Business (e.g., ECO 2251, ECO 
2252, and IS 2241). Transfer credit will not be allowed for any 
courses where assessments for accreditation purposes are being 
conducted. Courses not allowed to transfer for courses where as-
sessments are being conducted may be considered for SCOB elec-
tive courses. 

Students transferring from AACSB accredited schools or an 
appropriately accredited International institution must follow the 
same requirements listed above. Students who have completed the 
first 66 hours and have the required GPA will be assigned a major, 
an advisor, and will enroll in FIN 3331,QM 3345, IS 3310,  BUS 
3382, or ACT 3391 (for accounting majors only) , and other cours-
es appropriate to their major (12-18 hours). Please note other than 
for MGT 3300 and MKT 3300, 1000-2000-level courses generally 
do not transfer for 3000-level courses.  

Only those 1000-2000-level courses from AACSB accredited 
schools will be considered and evaluated for above 3300 Troy 
University level credit on a case-by- case basis. Students transfer-
ring from all other regionally accredited schools must have at least 
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FORENSIC ACCOUNTING (12 HOURS) 

ACT 3355 (3) Internal Auditing 

ACT 4498  (3) Fraud Examination 

LAW 4420  (3) Administrative Law 

LAW 4425 (3) Investigation and Evidence. 

 

FORENSIC ACCOUNTING 

CERTIFICATE (12 HOURS) 

ACT 3355 (3)  Internal Auditing 

ACT 4498  (3) Fraud Examination 

LAW 4420  (3) Administrative Law 

LAW 4425 (3)  Investigation and Evidence. 

 

A certificate in Forensic Accounting is available.  Students 

should contact the School of Accountancy for information 

about the certificate program.  Students seeking the certificate 

in Forensic Accounting must successfully complete the  

requirements for admission to the upper-level Business 

Program for the accounting major (see B.S.B.A. Business Ad-

ministration Degree Requirements) and must have successful-

ly completed the following prerequisite classes:  ACT 3391  

Intermediate Accounting I, ACT 3392 Intermediate Account-

ing II, and ACT 4497 Auditing.     

 

ECONOMICS MAJOR (36 HOURS) 

B.S.B.A. in Business Administration with a major in Economics. 

 

GENERAL ECONOMICS CONCENTRATION 

(36 HOURS) 
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MGT 4485 (3) Performance Appraisal & Compensation 

Electives 

Select two from the following list (6 Hours) 

MGT 4472 (3) Organizational Behavior 

MGT 4473 (3) Labor Law & Collective Bargaining 

MGT 4482  (3) Health/Safety/Diversity 

MGT 4496  (3) Selected Topics in HR 

 

INFORMATION SYSTEMS 

CONCENTRATION (18 HOURS) 

Required Classes (12 Hours): 

IS 3320 (3) Data Communications & Networks 

IS 3346 (3) Database MGT Systems I 

IS 3350 (3) Business Programming 

IS 4447 (3) Systems Analysis/Design 

 

Electives 

Select two from the following list (6 Hours) 

IS 4440 (3) Knowledge MGT/BUS Intelligence 

IS 4451 (3) Information Security, Assurance and 

  Compliance 

IS 4470
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PROMOTION MINOR (18 HOURS) 

ACT 2291 (3) Principles of Accounting I 

ECO 2252 (3) Principles of Microeconomics 

LAW 2221 (3) Legal Environment of Business 

MKT 3300 (3) Principles of Marketing 

MKT 3362 (3) Advertising 

MKT 4461 (3) Personal Selling 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 


